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Abstract 

The vocabulary mastery is very useful in helping the learners to develop the four English skills. 
The present research was conducted in order to create an attractive mini picture book to help the 
young learners, especially the young learners in the concrete operational stage, master the English 
vocabulary. There were five stages employed to develop the mini picture book, which were 
screening and filtering, searching for the suitable images of the setting and characters, placing and 
transferring the setting and characters’ images into the eight-page paper, editing the mini picture 
book’s quality, and organizing the storyline as well as giving a colorful book cover. By employing 
the mini picture book as the English learning medium in the classroom, it was found that the 
young learners are able to increase their vocabulary in both English and Madura language. Also, 
the young learners are able to learn the educative values of Karapan Sapi so that they will behave 
in accordance with the Indonesia’s local wisdom. 
 
Key words: Karapan Sapi, mini picture book, English vocabulary, young learners. 

 
 

INTRODUCTION 
 

The knowledge of English vocabulary 
is often considered as one of the important 
aspects in English language learning, since 
the mastery of English vocabulary might help 
the learners clearly express their ideas and 
understand to what other people are saying 
(Al Qahtaani, 2015:31). In addition, 
vocabulary is the central point in a language, 
so that the mastery of vocabulary is of the 
crucial importance to the English language 
learners. In a nutshell, the mastery of English 
vocabulary to the language learners plays an 
important role since it encourages the 
learners to develop the four English skills in 
ease. 

 Teaching English to young learners, 
especially for the mastery of English 
vocabulary, is not an easy job. Not only do 

the teachers need to develop the learning 
media which are able to stimulate the five 
senses of the young learners, but they also 
need to provide the attractive learning media 
to keep the learners’ learning interest. Brown 
(2001:87) proposed five characteristics of the 
young learners involving intellectual 
development, attention span, sensory input, 
affective factors, as well as authentic and 
meaningful language. The first characteristic 
of young learners, which is the intellectual 
development, refers to the concrete 
experiences to create a functional language 
learning purpose. The second characteristic of 
young learners refers to their inability to 
concentrate on the language learning for a 
long period of time. In other words, young 
learners have a short attention span. Thus, it 
is very important for the teacher to provide 
attractive learning media rather than the dull 
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ones. The third characteristic of the young 
learners, which is the sensory input, refers to 
the ability of the young learners to 
concentrate on the language learning if the 
teacher provides the multisensory learning 
media which are able to stimulate the 
learners’ five senses. The fourth characteristic 
of the young learners refers to their emotional 
sides and feeling involving the attitudes and 
motivation in English language learning. The 
last characteristic of the young learners, 
which is the authentic and meaningful 
language, refers to the young learners’ 
interest to the meaningful and authentic 
language learning media. 

 Considering the five characteristics 
of young learners stated by Brown (2001:87), 
it is very critical for the teacher to be able to 
prepare and provide an appropriate learning 
medium not only to fulfill the needs of the 
young learners but also to help them master 
the English vocabulary. One of many 
interesting learning media to be employed in 
teaching vocabulary to young learners is a 
mini picture book. According to Mourao 
(2016:39), a picture book is a simple picture-
word relationship with the text providing a 
supportive learning context. With the visual 
illustration along with the supportive text 
provided in a picture book, it might not only 
help the teacher keep the young learners’ 
interest in language learning but also develop 
the learners’ understanding of the world. 

In the Piagetian stages of development 
(Pinter, 2011:9), it is stated that there are four 
stages in the development of a child, which 
are the sensori-motor age within the age of 0-
2 years old, the pre-operational stage within 
the age of 2-7 years old, the concrete 
operational stage within the age of 7-11 years 
old, and the formal operational stage within 
the age of 12  years old and beyond. In the 
concrete operational stage, in which a child 
already has an ability to think operationally, 
use analogy competently, appreciate 
causality, develop the hierarchical 
classification, and create relational logic, 
there is a possibility for the language teachers 
to employ various activities and learning 
materials including a mini picture book. 

In a research conducted by Kaltsum 
and Wijayanti, (2012:191), it was found that 
the use of image or picture as a learning 
medium was able to develop the English 
learning outcomes of the young learners. The 
development of the English learning 
outcomes could be seen through the learners 
being actively engaged in the learning 
process. In addition, the development of the 
English learning outcomes of the young 
learners could also be seen through the 
learners’ ability to discuss, deliver ideas, as 
well as answer the teacher’s questions in 
English. In a nutshell, the use of picture as 
the learning medium was able to create a 
positive learning situation so that the learners 
could actively engage in the learning process 
and, at the same time, increase their English 
skill. 

However, even though a picture book 
is considered as a relevant and authentic 
learning media, there is a possibility that the 
teacher might have a difficulty in finding and 
selecting a picture book which is suitable to 
the young learners’ level. Also, the design of 
the picture book is often underestimate or 
overestimate the ability of the young learners 
which lessen the chances of the teacher to 
find an appropriate picture book for the 
young learners. Moreover, it is very rare to 
find an English picture book containing the 
value of Indonesia’s local wisdom. According 
to Sumardjoko (2013:121), the Indonesia’s 
local wisdom whose the main cores are the 
values of morality, respect, and harmony, are 
able to shape the learners to be the smart and 
kind-hearted problem-solvers in the society. 
Therefore, an English learning media, which 
is based on the Indonesia’s local wisdom, is 
needed in a language learning activity so that 
the teacher is capable to encourage the young 
learners to think globally yet act locally. 

 Karapan Sapi is one of the authentic 
cultures in Madura consisting the meaningful 
values of Indonesia’s local wisdom. Karapan 
Sapi defines the creativity side of the 
Maduranese people in fusing the system of 
beliefs, norm, cultures, and nature resources 
to create a meaningful value in the social life. 
Designing and developing a picture book of 
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Karapan Sapi, a folktale of Madura, might be 
able to create a positive learning situation for 
the young learners so that they will be able to 
learn English without ignoring their cultures. 
Furthermore, with the attractive pictures 
illustrating the storyline of Karapan Sapi 
folktale, along with the English and 
Maduranese vocabulary pertinent to the story 
written next to the pictures, are undoubtedly 
able to increase the young learners’ 
vocabulary on both English and Madura 
language. 
 
RESEARCH METHOD  

The design in developing the mini 
picture book was related to the ideas being 
discussed, which is to teach English 
vocabulary to the young learners using a mini 
picture book containing the story of 
Maduranese folktale “Karapan Sapi”.  

In developing the mini picture book, 
first, the researcher did the screening and 
filtering ideas. The screening and filtering 
stages were done to create an early story draft 
to make the storyline of the mini picture book 
be as closely as possible with the original 
story of Karapan Sapi.  

After conducting the screening and 
filtering stages, the researcher searched for 
the suitable images of the setting and the 
characters to create a perfect storyline of 
Karapan Sapi. The development of the mini 
picture book was continued by placing and 
transferring the setting and characters’ images 
into the eight-page paper of the mini picture 
book.  

After that, the editing to increase the 
mini picture book’s quality was done by 
sharpening the color of the images, enhancing 
the quality of the images, and giving the 
supporting text in both English and Madura 
language. The completion of developing the 
mini picture book was done by organizing the 
storyline and giving a colorful book cover to 
attract the young learners’ reading interest.  

The objective of developing the mini 
picture book of Maduranese folktale 
“Karapan Sapi” is to create a fun and 

attractive English learning medium in order 
to increase the young learners’ motivation in 
expanding their English vocabulary. In 
addition, the level of the storyline is 
presented by adjusting to the age of the 
young learners, which is around 8 up to 10 
years old, so that the teacher will be able to 
convey the English materials as well as the 
values of Indonesia’s local wisdom to the 
young learners in ease. 
 
 
RESULT AND DISCUSSION 

The present mini picture book is 
considered as a new innovation pertinent to 
the learning media in the world of education. 
A mini picture book containing English 
vocabulary as the materials presented in the 
form of visual images based on Indonesia’s 
folktale can be applied as a learning medium 
in the English classroom activity. In addition, 
developing and employing the present mini 
picture book in the learning activity can be a 
suitable learning medium in order to increase 
the motivation of learning and reading 
interest of the young learners in the concrete 
operational stage, create a fun learning 
atmosphere, and, at the same time, also instil 
the values of Indonesia’s local wisdom. 
 
 
Illustrations in the Mini Picture book 

In 1994, Sones conducted a research 
by dividing four hundred learners into two 
groups. Each learner in both groups had an 
equal or balanced in term of skills. In the 
research, the two groups took turns taking the 
lessons using comic and textbooks as the 
learning media. The results of the research 
showed that the learners who were given a 
comic as the learning medium got better 
results in the learning test compared to the 
learners who were given a textbook as the 
learning medium. According to the research 
results, Sones (1994, in Wuriyanto, 2009) 
concluded that the illustrations existed in the 
comic or picture book had a very big impact 
for the learners. In other words, the quality of 
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images provided in a comic or picture book 
was able to improve the quality of the 
learning outcomes. Therefore, the design and 
illustration of the mini picture book as a 
learning medium had been taken into account 
so that it will be able to not only increase the 
young learners’ reading interest but also able 
to assist the young learners in increasing their 
English vocabulary. In addition, since 
children already have a full emergence of 
symbolic thought in the concrete operational 
stage in which they are able to make one 
thing stand for another (Pinter, 2011:9), the 
mini picture book will also be able to instil 
the educative values and beliefs contained in 
the Maduranese folktale “Karapan Sapi” as 
one of the Indonesia’s local wisdom. 
 
Setting and Characterization 

The characters involved in the 
storyline play a very important role in the 
mini picture book, since, through these 
figures, the teacher is able to convey the 
information and messages to the young 
learners. In the mini picture book containing 
the English vocabulary as the materials, the 
characters had been adjusted in such a way in 
order to attract the young learner’s reading 
interest. The appearance of the images, the 
facial expressions as well as the attitudes of 
the characters had been adjusted and 
designed as good as possible to show the high 
standard and positive behaviors of the 
Indonesia’s people. In addition, the characters 
of the present mini picture book were 
designed to be able to become the role 
models for the young learners as well.  For 
example, the character of the King of 
Sumenep was designed to be a wise and 
humble leader. Furthermore, the character of 
the Farmer was designed to show the 
creativity of the Indonesia’s people. 
According to the Piagetian stages of 
development, in the concrete operatinal stage, 
children have already had an operational 
thought in which they are able to think in 
logical fashion (Pinter, 2011:9). Thus, by 
employing the mini picture book in the 
language learning classroom, it is not only 
able to assist the young learners in improving 

English vocabulary but also able to provide 
the valuable character education for the 
young learners in accordance with the 
Indonesia’s local wisdom. 

 
Picture Design 

The material and information that the 
teacher wants to deliver and convey to the 
young learners can easily be channeled 
through the images in the mini picture book. 
However, it is the teacher’s obligation to 
carefully list the material-related illustrations 
due to the fact that there is a possibility in 
providing a misleading illustration that might 
damage the young learners’ understanding 
towards the English materials. 

The mini picture book containing the 
story of Maduranese folktale “Karapan Sapi” 
had been designed in such a way in which all 
the images had been given the attractive 
colorings. Moreover, the coloring images 
come with the supporting texts related to the 
story in both English and Madura language. 
With the English and Madura language 
supporting texts placed next to each picture, 
it is expected for the young learners to 
understand the folktale in ease. In addition, 
the supporting texts are expected to assist the 
young learners in increasing their vocabulary 
in both English and Madura language. 
Furthermore, since children already have an 
ability of decentration in which they are able 
to deal with more than on aspect (Pinter, 
2011:10), the existence of the supporting text 
in the local language put in the mini picture 
book was designed in order to help the young 
learners not only able to master the 
international language but also master the 
local language which becomes the pride of 
the Indonesia’s rich cultures. 
 
Storyline 

The mini picture book with a load of 
Maduranese folktale “Karapan Sapi” tells 
about the King of Sumenep who saw one of 
his farmers riding a plough pulled by a cow 
in the field. The humble King was so curious 
with the interesting activity so that he decided 
to try riding the plough pulled by the cow. 
The King was so surprised to find that riding 
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a plough pulled by a cow was a fascinating 
activity. Furthermore, the King also had an 
idea that the interesting plowing method 
invented by the creative farmer would help 
all the farmers in his kingdom to plow the 
fields in ease. Therefore, the King decided to 
teach all his people to ride the plough pulled 
by a cow in their fields. 

The storyline in the present mini 
picture book was made as closely as possible 
with the original sequence of the story so that 
the young learners will also be able to learn 
the culture and the local language of 
Indonesia. The storyline in the mini picture 
book also contains the moral value derived 
from the Maduranese folktale “Karapan 
Sapi”, such as it would be very wise for the 
leader in a region, or even the leader in a 
country, to take a  useful and meaningful 
suggestion from his/her people in order to 
develop the region or the country in a 
creative and futuristic way and make all the 
people more prosperous. 

In the concrete operational stage, 
children have a gradual loss of egocentricity; 
thus, they have a capability to lower their 
inhibition in order to be able to learn and 
absorb new materials in the language learning 
in ease, including the English vocabulary. 
Therefore, by using the present mini picture 
book as a learning medium, the young 
learners are expected to be able to increase 
their English vocabulary. Furthermore, it is 
also expected that the young learners are able 
to learn and understand the local language as 
well as the moral values based on the 
Indonesia’s local wisdom. 
 
CONCLUSION  

The present mini picture book of 
Maduranese folktale “Karapan Sapi” can be 
used as a learning medium to assist the young 
learners in developing and increasing their 
English vocabulary. With the colorful 
illustrations and attractive images, the mini 
picture book is able to attract the young 
learners to read and understand the storyline 
presented. In addition, with the supporting 

texts available in English and Madura 
language, the young learners are not only 
able to increase their English vocabulary but 
also able to increase their Madura language 
vocabulary. By studying and mastering the 
local language and the folktale of Karapan 
Sapi, the young learners are able to develop 
their characters and attitudes based on the 
beliefs and values of the Maduranese folktale. 
Therefore, the young learners in the concrete 
operatioinal stage have a capability to think 
globally yet, at the same time, act locally 
based on the Indonesia’ local wisdom. 
 
SUGGESTION 

The suggested recommendations 
given for the product usage, among others: 
(1) For the English teachers, the mini picture 
book should be used as an innovative, 
creative, and effective English learning 
medium in the classroom as a companion of 
the textbooks. Furthermore, the mini picture 
book should be interspersed with other 
learning media so that the students are able to 
increase the English vocabulary in a useful 
and meaningful learning situation; (2) For the 
future researchers, in the process of creating 
and developing a mini picture book, the 
critical aspects should be paid more 
attentions, such as the process of making 
illustrations, creating the storylines, 
enhancing the coloring’s quality, as well as 
loading the important information contained 
in the mini picture book. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Authors Name                                                                         ISBN.	
 

6 | P a g e  
 

REFERENCES 
Alqahtani, Mofareh. 2015. “The Importance 

of Vocabulary in Language Learning 
and How to be Taught”. International 
Journal of Teaching and Educatioin, 
Volume III, No.3, 21-34. 

Brown, Douglas. 2001. Teaching by 
Principles: An Interactive Approach to 
Language Pedagogy Second Edition. 
London: Longman. 

Kaltsum, Honest Ummi, Wijayanti, Noviana. 
2012. “Peningkatan Aktivitas 
Pembelajaran Bahasa Inggris Melalui 
Strategi Savi (Somatic, Auditory, 
Visualization, Intellectualy) dengan 
Media Gambar terhadap Siswa Kelas 
IV Sd Negeri 1 Sonorejo Blora” dalam 
Jurnal Varia Pendidikan, vol.24, no.2, 
hlm. 191. 

Mourao, Sandie. 2016. “Picturebooks in the 
Primary EFL Classroom: Authentic 
Literature for an Authentic Response”. 
Children’s Literature in English 
Language Education Journal, Volume 
4, Issue 1, 25-43. 

Pinter, Annamaria. 2011. Children Learning 
Second Languages. UK: Palgrave  
Macmillan. 

Sumardjoko, Bambang. 2013. “Revitalisasi 
Nilai-Nilai Pancasila Melalui 
Pembelajaran PKn Berbasis Kearifan 
Lokal untuk Penguatan Karakter dan 
Jati Diri Bangsa” dalam Jurnal Varia 
Pendidikan, vol.25, no.2, hlm. 121. 

Wuriyanto, Eko. 2009. “Komik sebagai 
Media Pembelajaran”, 
(http://guruindo.blogspot.com/2009/0
6/komik-sebagai-media-
pembelajaran.html) accessed at 8 
March 2018. 


